
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  MSc Podiatry (pre-registration) 

Education provider University of Brighton 

Mode of delivery  FTA (Full time accelerated) 

Date of decision 25 May 2017 

 
Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Sonya Lam 
 Maureen Drake Gavin Scott 
 Sue Gallone  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  BSc (Hons) Podiatry 

Education provider University of Brighton 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Date of decision 25 May 2017 

 
Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Sonya Lam 
 Maureen Drake Gavin Scott 
 Sue Gallone  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  BSc (Hons) Diagnostic Radiography 

Education provider Canterbury Christ Church University 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Date of decision 25 May 2017 

 
Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Sonya Lam 
 Maureen Drake Gavin Scott 
 Sue Gallone  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  BSc (Hons) Occupational Therapy 

Education provider Canterbury Christ Church University 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Date of decision 25 May 2017 

 
Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Sonya Lam 
 Maureen Drake Gavin Scott 
 Sue Gallone  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  BA (Hons) in Social Work 

Education provider Canterbury Christ Church University 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Date of decision 25 May 2017 

 
Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Sonya Lam 
 Maureen Drake Gavin Scott 
 Sue Gallone  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  BSc (Hons) Paramedic Science 

Education provider Canterbury Christ Church University 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Date of decision 25 May 2017 

 
Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Sonya Lam 
 Maureen Drake Gavin Scott 
 Sue Gallone  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  BSc (Hons) Operating Department Practice 

Education provider Canterbury Christ Church University 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Date of decision 25 May 2017 

 
Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Sonya Lam 
 Maureen Drake Gavin Scott 
 Sue Gallone  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  MSc Occupational Therapy 

Education provider University of Derby 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Date of decision 25 May 2017 

 
Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Sonya Lam 
 Maureen Drake Gavin Scott 
 Sue Gallone  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  BSc (Hons) Occupational Therapy 

Education provider University of Derby 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Date of decision 25 May 2017 

 
Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Sonya Lam 
 Maureen Drake Gavin Scott 
 Sue Gallone  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  BSc (Hons) Occupational Therapy 

Education provider University of Derby 

Mode of delivery  PT (Part time) 

Date of decision 25 May 2017 

 
Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Sonya Lam 
 Maureen Drake Gavin Scott 
 Sue Gallone  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  BSc (Hons) Occupational Therapy 

Education provider University of Derby 

Mode of delivery  FTA (Full time accelerated) 

Date of decision 25 May 2017 

 
Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Sonya Lam 
 Maureen Drake Gavin Scott 
 Sue Gallone  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  PG Dip Occupational Therapy 

Education provider University of Derby 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Date of decision 25 May 2017 

 
Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Sonya Lam 
 Maureen Drake Gavin Scott 
 Sue Gallone  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  BSc (Hons) Radiography (Diagnostic Imaging) 

Education provider Keele University 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Date of decision 25 May 2017 

 
Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Sonya Lam 
 Maureen Drake Gavin Scott 
 Sue Gallone  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  BSc (Hons) Speech and Language Therapy 

Education provider University of Manchester 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Date of decision 25 May 2017 

 
Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Sonya Lam 
 Maureen Drake Gavin Scott 
 Sue Gallone  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  Masters in Speech and Language Therapy 

Education provider University of Manchester 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Date of decision 25 May 2017 

 
Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Sonya Lam 
 Maureen Drake Gavin Scott 
 Sue Gallone  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  BSc (Hons) Paramedic Science 

Education provider Sheffield Hallam University 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Date of decision 25 May 2017 

 
Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Sonya Lam 
 Maureen Drake Gavin Scott 
 Sue Gallone  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  PGCert Approved Mental Health Professional 

Education provider University of the West of England, Bristol 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Date of decision 25 May 2017 

 
Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Sonya Lam 
 Maureen Drake Gavin Scott 
 Sue Gallone  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  PGCert Approved Mental Health Professional 

Education provider University of the West of England, Bristol 

Mode of delivery  PT (Part time) 

Date of decision 25 May 2017 

 
Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Sonya Lam 
 Maureen Drake Gavin Scott 
 Sue Gallone  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair 



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  Diploma Higher Education Paramedic Studies 

Education provider Anglia Ruskin University 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Date of decision 25 May 2017 

 
Panel: Sonya Lam (Chair) Sue Gallone 
 Maureen Drake Gavin Scott 
   

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Sonya Lam, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  BSc (Hons) Paramedic Science 

Education provider Anglia Ruskin University 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Date of decision 25 May 2017 

 
Panel: Sonya Lam (Chair) Sue Gallone 
 Maureen Drake Gavin Scott 
   

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Sonya Lam, Panel Chair 
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